ORDINANCE NO. 2017-0-02

AN ORDINANCE ADOPTING UPDATED FIRE PREVENTION CODES AND
STANDARDS PARALLEL TO NATIONAL STANDARDS BY THE
DEERFIELD-BANNOCKBURN FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT, LAKE COUNTY, ILLINOIS

WHEREAS, the Deerfield-Bannockburn Fire Protection District (the “District”), Lake
County, lllinois, is a fire protection district duly incorporated under the laws of the State of
lllinois, including the lllinois Fire Protection District Act (the “Act”, 70 ILCS 705/0.01 et seq.); and

WHEREAS, the Board of Trustees of the District (the “Board”) has full power pursuant to
Section 6(i) of the Act (70 ILCS 705/6(i)), to pass all necessary ordinances, and rules and
regulations for the proper management and conduct of the business of the Board for carrying into
effect the objects for which the District was formed; and

WHEREAS, the Board has express power pursuant to Section 11 of the Act (70 ILCS
705/11) to adopt and enforce fire prevention codes and standards parallel to national standards to
promote fire prevention; and

WHEREAS, Section 11 of the Act (70 ILCS 705/11) empowers and makes it the legal duty
and obligation of the District’'s Board to provide as nearly adequate protection from fire for all
persons and property within the District as possible and to prescribe necessary regulations for the
prevention and control of fire therein; and

WHEREAS, the District is empowered by the Act to provide reasonable safeguards
through Fire Prevention Codes to protect the Public Health and Safety against the hazards of fire
in buildings and structures; and

WHEREAS, pursuant to said authority the Board previously adopted Ordinance 92-O-162
KNOX BOXES on September 10, 1992 [“Ord. 92-O-162"}, Ordinance 2009-04 AN ORDINANCE
REGULATING AND CODIFYING THE AUTOMATIC FIRE SPRINKLER SYSTEM CODE OF THE
DEERFIELD-BANNOCKBURN FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT on August 13, 2009 [“Ord. 2009-

04"], and Ordinance 201-O-01 AN ORDINANCE AMENDING ORDINANCE 2009-0O-05

DEERFIELD-BANNOCK FPD / General / Ord 2017-0-02 Adopting the 2012 Int'l Fire Code /234746



REGULATING AND CODIFYING THE AUTOMATIC FIRE ALARM AND DETECTION SYSTEM
CODE OF THE DEERFIELD-BANNOCKBURN FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT on February 11,
2010 [*Ord. 2010-0-017]; and

WHEREAS, the Board finds and determines that newer, more updated and
comprehensive fire prevention codes and standards parallel to national standards have been
promulgated by nationally recognized authorities, such as the International Code Council’'s
International Fire Code, 2012 Edition [‘2012 IFC”]; and

WHEREAS, on advise of staff the Board finds and determines that adoption of the 2012
IFC, with certain amendments, would be in the best interest of the residents of District; and

WHEREAS, the District's Board adopts the 2012 IFC, which is a comprehensive
compilation of codes designed to meet the needs of the local fire jurisdictions through model code
regulations that prescribe safeguards for the safety and public health of all communities, except
as amended in Exhibit A attached hereto.

NOW, THEREFORE, Be It Ordained, by the Board of Trustees of the Deerfield-
Bannockburn Fire Protection District, Lake County, lllinois, as follows:

Section One: The Board finds and determines the above recitals to be true and
correct, and incorporates them as if written out here in full.

Section Two: The District's Board adopts the 2012 IFC, except as amended in
Exhibit A attached hereto. At least three (3) copies of said 2012 IFC, as amended, shall be
placed on file with the District and shall be available for public inspection at all times during regular
business hours as provided by law.

Section Three: That it shall be unlawful to design, construct, alter, enlarge, repair,
demolish, remove, use or maintain any building or structure within the boundaries of the Deerfield-

Bannockburn Fire Protection District in violation of any terms or provisions of this Ordinance.

DEERFIELD-BANNOCK FPD / General / Ord 2017-0-02 Adopting the 2012 Int'l Fire Code /234746



Section Four: That the specific terms and conditions of this Ordinance shall
prevail against other existing ordinances of the District to the extent that there might be any
conflict.

Section Five: The Board hereby repeals Ord. 92-0-162, Ord. 2009-04, and Ord.
2010-0O-01 except as to application and enforcement actions underway and on-going at the time
of adoption of this Ordinance 2017-0-01.

Section Six: All persons in violation of the 2012 IFC, as amended herein, shall
be subjected to fines as set forth and established in the District’s Ordinance 2017-0-03, adopted
May 11, 2017. Any person, business, firm, corporation, entity or property owner with a proven
violation of this Code shall be responsible for all fees, costs and expenses, including but not
limited to attorney fees, litigation, adjudication and settlement costs, incurred by the Algonquin-
Lake in the Hills Fire Protection District in enforcing the provisions of the adopted Code.

Section Seven: Future versions of the District's 2012 IFC may be revised by Board

approval of amendment to the current Exhibit A. All such revisions shall be dated and shall be
effective upon approval by the Board of Trustees.

Section Eight: The Board of Trustees of the District hereby declares that should
any section, paragraph, sentence or word of this Ordinance or of the Code hereby adopted be
declared for any reason to be invalid, it is the intent of said Board of Trustees that it would have
passed all other portions of this Ordinance independent of the elimination here from of such
portion as may be declared invalid.

Section Nine: Neither the enactment of this Ordinance nor the repeal of any
ordinance or parts of ordinances as provided for herein shall be construed to affect or abate any
action or cause of action for violation of said prior ordinance or ordinances.

Section Ten: That this Ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after its

passage and approval in accordance with the law.

DEERFIELD-BANNOCK FPD / General / Ord 2017-0-02 Adopting the 2012 Int'l Fire Code /234746



ADOPTED this 11th day of May, 2017, by the following roll call vote:
aves:_enier . Q)Mkemeu‘ er, \J@n&eﬂ

NAYS: Q 0N,

Vo
ABSENT:__ INOQE

;

Philip Bettiker, President, Board of Trustees
Deerfield-Bannockburn Fire Protection District

ATTEST:

77 e
Jeffrey Harfsen, Secfetary, Board of Trustees

Deerfield-Bannockburn Fire Protection District

DEERFIELD-BANNOCK FPD / General / Ord 2017-0-02 Adopting the 2012 Int'| Fire Code /234746



ORDINANCE NO. 2017-0-02

AN ORDINANCE ADOPTING UPDATED FIRE PREVENTION CODES AND
STANDARDS PARALLEL TO NATIONAL STANDARDS BY THE
DEERFIELD-BANNOCKBURN FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT, LAKE COUNTY, ILLINOIS

EXHIBIT A
Amendments to the International Code Council’s International Fire Code, 2012 Edition
[12 pages, attached following]

DEERFIELD-BANNOCK FPD / General / Ord 2017-0-02 Adopting the 2012 Int'l Fire Code /234746



Deerfield Bannockburn Fire Department

2012 International Fire Code Amendments

Notes:
1) The word District in these amendments shall mean the Deerfield Bannockburn Fire

Protection District.

New Section 105.8 shall be added to read as follows:

105.8 Plan review and site inspection fee schedule.

Each applicant shall pay the following plan review and site inspection fees for review and site
inspection by the Deerfield-Bannockburn Fire Protection District Fire Prevention Bureau. No
part of said fees shall be refundable. Plan reviews shall include re-reviews, along with
preliminary site visits up to a total of two (2) inspections for each category.

In addition to the review fees listed, the applicant shall pay, prior to the issuance of any permit,
the actual costs and expenses incurred by Deerfield-Bannockburn Fire Protection District for
extraordinary reviews of plans or specifications beyond the review customarily involved in the
usual course of such plan reviews. Such costs and expenses shall include actual review fees by
consultants or outside contractors or time spent by Deerfield-Bannockburn Fire Protection
District staff.

New Section 105.8.1 shall be added to read as follows:
105.8.1 Permit fee schedule for automatic sprinkler systems and associated equipment.
1. NFPA 13 & 13R Systems:

1 — 10 Sprinklers $200.00
10 — 19 Sprinklers 250.00
20 — 100 Sprinklers 350.00
101 — 200 Sprinklers 450.00
201 — 300 Sprinklers 500.00
Over 301 Sprinklers 500.00 plus $1 per sprinkler over 300

2. NFPA 13D Systems:
Flat Rate of $250.00 for systems with less than 50 sprinklers.
Add $1 per sprinkler over 50 for larger systems.

3. Fire Pump Installation (new or replacement) $150.00

4. Standpipe Riser $150.00 (per riser)

New Section 105.8.2 shall be added to read as follows:
105.8.2 Permit fee schedule for automatic fire alarm systems.
1-10 Devices $200.00
11-20 Devices  275.00
21-50 Devices  350.00
51-75 Devices  425.00
76-100 Devices 500.00
Larger systems $500.00 plus $5.00 per device over 100

DEERFIELD-BANNOCK FPD / General / Ord 2017-0-02 Adopting the 2012 Int'l Fire Code /234746



New Section 105.8.3 shall be added to read as follows:

105.8.3 Permit fee automatic fixed extinguishing systems.
1. Kitchen suppression systems (per system) $200.00
2. Specialized suppression system (per system) $200.00
3. Each additional system $100.00

Section 108.1 shall be amended to read as follows:

108.1 Board of appeals established.

Whenever the Code Official shall disapprove an application, or refuse to grant permission or
when it is claimed that the true intent and meaning of the Ordinance have been misconstrued or
wrongly interpreted, the applicant or person affected may appeal the decision of the Code
Official to the Chief of the Deerfield-Bannockburn Fire Protection District by written notice filed
in the Deerfield-Bannockburn Fire Protection District Chief’s office within five (5) days from
the date of the decision being appealed. The said Chief shall render a decision on said appeal
within fifteen (15) days of said notice. If the Chief’s decision does not resolve the matter, the
applicant or person affected may appeal to the Deerfield-Bannockburn Fire Protection District
Board of Trustees by written notice filed in the Deerfield-Bannockburn Fire Protection District’s
administrative offices within ten (10) days of the said Chief’s decision. The Board of Trustees
shall call a hearing on said appeal within forty five (45) days of said notice of appeal filing, and
shall render a decision within ten (10) days after completing such hearings. 4 Nothing herein
shall restrict the Code Official from seeking immediate enforcement of the regulation of this
Ordinance in Court where the hazard involved requires such action.

Section 202, General Definitions, Fire Area, shall be amended by replacing the existing language
with the following text:

Fire Area. The aggregate floor area enclosed and bounded by the exterior walls of a building.
Areas of the building not provided with surrounding walls shall be included in the fire area if
such areas are included within the horizontal projection of the roof or floor next above.

Section 901.2 shall be amended by adding the following sentence to the end of the existing text:
901.2 Construction documents. Three sets of plans, specifications, and calculations shall be
submitted for all fire protection system permit review.

1. Fire alarm submittals shall comply with Chapter 7 of NFPA 72

2. Fire sprinkler system submittals shall comply with NFPA 13

3. All other fire protection system submittals shall comply with the appropriate
NFPA standard
4. Payment for plan reviews, and required system inspections required by the

District and this code, shall be paid to the District at the time that the plans are
submitted for review.

Section 901.4.6 shall be amended by adding the following sentence to the end of the existing
text:

901.4.6 Pump and riser room size. Rooms containing fire pumps shall be provided with a
door allowing access directly to/from the exterior of the building or structure. Such doors shall
be not less than 36 inches in width by 80 inches in height.

DEERFIELD-BANNOCK FPD / General / Ord 2017-0-02 Adopting the 2012 Int'l Fire Code /234746



Section 902 add additional definitions:
False Fire Alarm see Section 907.10

Section 901.9 shall be amended to read as follows:

901.9 Termination of monitoring service. For fire protection systems required to monitored
by this code and as amended by the District, notice shall be made to the fire code official
whenever alarm monitoring services are terminated. Notice shall be in writing to the fire code
official, by the monitoring service provider who’s service is being terminated, not less than five
business days before service is terminated.

Revise Section 903.2.1.1 as follows:
903.2.1.1 Group A-1. Delete 12,000 square feet; Insert 2,500 square feet

Revise Section 903.2.1.2 as follows:
903.2.1.2 Group A-2. Delete 5,000 square feet; Insert 2,500 square feet

Revise Section 903.2.1.3 as follows:
903.2.1.3 Group A-3. Delete 12,000 square feet; Insert 2,500 square feet

Revise Section 903.2.1.4 as follows:
903.2.1.4 Group A-4. Delete 12,000 square feet; Insert 2,500 square feet

Revise Section 903.2.3 as follows:
903.2.3 Group E. Delete 12,000 square feet; Insert 2,500 square feet

Revise Section 903.2.4 as follows:
903.2.4 Group F-1. Delete 12,000 square feet; Insert 2,500 square feet
Sub-paragraph 3. Delete

Revise Section 903.2.6, Exception 3 by adding the following sentence:
3. This exception does not apply to day care facilities exceeding 2,500 square feet in

area.

Revise Section 903.2.7 as follows:
903.2.7 Group M and Group B. This section shall apply to both Group M and B and all
references to Group M shall also include Group B.

Sub-paragraph 1. Delete 12,000 square feet; Insert 2,500 square feet

Sub-paragraph 3. Delete

Sub-paragraph 4. Delete 5,000 square feet, Insert 2,500 square feet

Revise Section 903.2.9 as follows:
903.2.9 Group S-1 and Group S-2. This section shall apply to both Group S-1 and S-2 and all
references to Group S-1 shall also include Group S-2.

Sub-paragraph 1. Delete 12,000 square feet; Insert 2,500 square feet

Sub-paragraph 3. Delete

Sub-paragraph 4. Delete 5,000 square feet; Insert 2,500 square feet

DEERFIELD-BANNOCK FPD / General / Ord 2017-0-02 Adopting the 2012 Int'| Fire Code /234746



Revise Section 903.2.9.1 as follows:

903.2.9.1 Repair garages.
Sub-paragraph 1. Delete 10,000 square feet; Insert 2,500 square feet
Sub-paragraph 2. Delete 12,000 square feet; Insert 2,500 square feet
Sub-paragraph 4. Delete 5,000 square feet, Insert 2,500 square feet

Revise Section 903.2.10 as follows:
903.2.10 Group S-2. Delete 12,000 square feet; Insert 2,500 square feet

Revise Section 903.2.10.1 as follows:
903.2.10.1 Commercial parking garages. Delete 5,000 square feet; Insert 2,500 square feet

Revise Section 903.2.11.1.3 as follows:
903.2.11.1.3 Basements. Delete 75 feet; Insert 50 feet

New Section 903.2.13 shall be added to read as follows:
One- and two-family dwellings, townhouses and similar. An automatic fire sprinkler system
shall be provided within all structures, or portions of structures, regulated by the 2012 edition of
the International Residential Code were required below:

1. Throughout all new one- and two-family dwellings, townhouses and similar structures

2. Throughout all additions to existing one- and two-family dwellings, townhouses and
similar structures which result in an increase in the square footage of a structure by 50%
immediately, or where the aggregate total of additions made over a period of 10-years
increase, buy 50%, the square footage of the structure which existed prior to the first
addition

3. Throughout all portions of structures which are being remodeled, renovated, or rebuilt to
the extent that 75% of the structure has been affected immediately, or where the
aggregate total of all work made over a period of 10-years

Exception: Work limited to the removal and replacement of interior or exterior wall
finishes, plumbing, electrical, or mechanical systems do not constitute a structure being
remodeled, renovated or rebuilt for the purposes of this requirement.

Section 903.3.7 shall be amended by adding the following sentence to the end of the existing
text:

903.3.7 Fire department connections. Fire department connections shall be located within 100
feet of a fire hydrant supplied by a municipal water system.

New Section 903.3.8 shall be added to read as follows:

903.3.8 Backflow protection. Fire sprinkler systems shall be provided with backflow protection
equipment in accordance with the rules and regulations found in the Illinois State Plumbing
code. Metering of fire sprinkler system water through the backflow protection equipment shall
be as required by the applicable municipal jurisdiction or water purveyor.

DEERFIELD-BANNOCK FPD / General / Ord 2017-0-02 Adopting the 2012 Int'l| Fire Code /234746



Section 903.4 shall be amended to read as follows:
903.4 Sprinkler system supervision and alarms.
Delete: Exceptions 5 & 7

Section 903.4.1 shall be amended to read as follows:
903.4.1 Monitoring. Fire alarm control units required by Section 903.4 shall be monitored as
required by Section 907.6.5 as amended.

Exceptions: Exceptions shall remain as written.

New Section 903.4.2.1 shall be added to read as follows:

903.4.2.1 Exterior visual alarms. In addition to the audible device required by 903.4.2, an
approved visual appliance shall be provided over the fire department connection in an approved
location. The visual appliance shall be connected to the building fire alarm system and shall be
operate only upon the activation of a waterflow device. The visual appliance shall be red in
color.

New Section 903.4.4 shall be added to read as follows:

903.4.4 Low temperature monitoring. Fire pump rooms, fire sprinkler riser rooms, and
standpipe riser rooms, which are heated by an individual heat source dedicated to the room, shall
be provided with a listed room temperature supervisory signal-initiating device, operating as
required by Section 17.16.5 of NFPA 72, and supervised by the building fire alarm system.

New Section 903.4.5 shall be added to read as follows:

903.4.5 Multi-tenant occupancies. In new multi-tenant, one-story buildings protected by an
automatic sprinkler system, the sprinklers in each tenant space shall be zoned separately from the
sprinklers in other tenant spaces located in the building. Supervised tenant space control valves
and waterflow devices shall be provided for each tenant space and shall be located at the front or
the rear of each tenant space consistently throughout the building. An exterior visible
notification appliance shall be provided over the main entrance of each tenant space which
indicates that the waterflow device serving the tenant space has activated. The appliance shall be
a weatherproof appliance, with a clear lens, and shall be not less than 75 c¢d. The visual
appliance shall be red in color.

New Section 903.6.1 shall be added to read as follows:

903.6.1 Change of use group. Where a building or tenant space experiences a change in
occupancy classification the requirements of Section 903, as amended by the District, shall be
applied to the building or tenant space as would be required for new buildings.

When the change in use group occurs in a single tenant space the sprinkler system requirements
shall only be required for the individual tenant space. Where the tenant space is located in a
multiple tenant building without an existing sprinkler system, the owner of the building shall
provide a sprinkler system riser, or risers, capable of serving the entire building and the tenant
space undergoing the change in use group shall be connected to the sprinkler system riser.
Where the tenant space is located in a multiple tenant space building and there is an existing
sprinkler system, the tenant space undergoing the change in use shall be connected to the existing
building sprinkler system.

DEERFIELD-BANNOCK FPD / General / Ord 2017-0-02 Adopting the 2012 Int'| Fire Code /234746



Revise Section 905.3.1 as follows:
905.3.1 Height. Delete 30 feet; Insert 18 feet

New Section 905.12 shall be added to read as follows:
905.12 Fire department connections. Fire department connections serving standpipe
connections shall be provided as required by Section 903.3.7 as amended.

Section 907.2.1 shall be amended to read as follows:
907.2.1 Group A.
Delete: Exception

Section 907.2.2 shall be amended to read as follows:
907.2.2 Group B.
Delete: Exception

Section 907.2.3 shall be amended to read as follows:
907.2.3 Group E.
Delete: Three (3) exceptions

Section 907.2.4 shall be amended to read as follows:
907.2.4 Group F.
Delete: Exception

Section 907.2.7 shall be amended to read as follows:
907.2.7 Group M.
Delete: Two (2) exceptions

Section 907.2.8.1 shall be amended to read as follows:
907.2.8.1 Group (R-1) Manual fire alarm system.
Delete: Exception 2

Section 907.2.9.1 shall be amended to read as follows:
907.2.9.1 Group (R-2) Manual fire alarm system.
Delete: Exception 2

New Section 907.2.9.4 (Group R-2) shall be added to read as follows:
907.2.9.4. An automatic smoke detection system shall be provided as required by Section
907.2.8.2 and its exception.

Section 907.2.10.1 shall be amended to read as follows:
907.2.10.1 Group (R-4) Manual fire alarm system.
Delete: Exception 2

New Section 907.6.3 shall be added to read as follows:
907.6.3 Initiating device identification. The fire alarm system shall identify the specific
initiating device address, location, device type, floor level where applicable, and status including
indication of system normal, alarm, supervisory, and trouble status, as appropriate.
Exceptions:
1. Fire alarm systems in single-story buildings less than 22,500 square feet in

area.

DEERFIELD-BANNOCK FPD / General / Ord 2017-0-02 Adopting the 2012 Int'l Fire Code /234746



2. Fire alarm systems in single-story, single-tenant buildings that include only
manual fire alarm boxes, waterflow devices on individual zones, and necessary
automatic detection protection at the fire alarm control unit.

3. Fire alarm systems supervising suppression systems when a fire alarm system
would otherwise not be required in the building or tenant space.

4. Fire alarm systems or devices that are replacing existing equipment.

Section 907.6.3 shall be renumbered as follows:
907.6.3.1 Zones.

New Section 907.6.3.2 shall be added to read as follows:

907.6.3.2 Multi-tenant occupancies. In multi-tenant, one-story buildings served by a fire alarm
system which includes notification appliances serving more than a single tenant, an exterior
visible notification appliance shall be provided over the main entrance of each tenant space in a
location approved by the fire code official. The appliance shall be a weatherproof appliance,
with a clear lens, and shall be not less than 75 cd.

Section 907.6.5 shall be amended to read as follows:

907.6.5 Monitoring. Fire alarm system required by this chapter as amended by the District or
the International Building Code, shall be monitored at a supervising station approved by the
District in accordance with NFPA 72. The means to transmit fire alarm signals shall be a private
one-way radio network in accordance with Section 26.6.5.2 of NFPA 72-2016 edition.

Fire alarm systems which are not required by this chapter as amended by the District or the
International Building Code, may be supervised at any listed central station, or other location
approved by the fire code official. The means to transmit fire alarm signals shall be a private
one-way radio network in accordance with Section 26.6.5.2 of NFPA 72-2016 edition.

Fire alarm control units shall have the capability of transmitting alarm, supervisory (where
applicable), and trouble signals to the supervising station through a reverse polarity outputs to
the private one-way radio.

A person, business or corporation residing or having a place of business within the Fire District
who fails to comply requirements specified in this Section as it pertains to installation of an
approved means of transmitting a fire alarm signal shall be deemed to be in violation of this
Section, and shall be subject to a fine of not less than One Hundred Dollars ($100.00) per week
of non-compliance, as measured from Midnight on Monday though one (1) minute prior to
Midnight on the following Sunday, regardless of weekday, weekend or holiday designation.
Exceptions: Monitoring by a supervising station shall not be required for:

1. Single- and multiple-station smoke alarms required by 907.2.11
2. Smoke detectors in Group I-3 occupancies
3. Automatic sprinkler systems in one- and two-family dwellings

Section 907.9.1 shall be amended to read as follows:

907.9.1 Change of use group. Where a building or tenant space experiences a change in
occupancy classification the requirements of Section 907, as amended by the District, shall be
applied to the building or tenant space as would be required for new buildings.

When the change in use group occurs in a single tenant space the fire alarm requirements shall
only be required for the individual tenant space. Where the tenant space is located in a multiple
tenant building without an existing fire alarm system, the owner of the building shall provide a
fire alarm system capable of serving the entire building and the tenant space undergoing the

DEERFIELD-BANNOCK FPD / General / Ord 2017-0-02 Adopting the 2012 Int'l Fire Code /234746



change in use group shall be connected to the new building fire alarm system. Where the tenant
space is located in a multiple tenant space building and there is an existing fire alarm system, the
tenant space undergoing the change in use shall be connected to the existing building fire alarm
system.

No building shall be served by multiple fire alarm control units and systems without the systems
being interconnected as required by NFPA 72.

New Section 907.10 shall be added to read as follows:

907.10 False fire alarms. An alarm signal which indicates the existence of any emergency
situation when in fact, no such emergency exists, and shall include any alarm signal
generated by any fire protection system by whatever means shall be considered a false
alarm. A fire alarm user is defined as the owner of the property from which the false alarm
originates and any individual, partnership, corporation, organization or other entity
occupying or on the property with permission of the owner. A fire alarm user shall be fined
for each fire alarm if such false alarm is:

1. Given intentionally or negligently.

2. Due to or caused by improper installation, design or use or due to a lack of
required maintenance.

3. Resulting from any test, repair, alteration or addition to the fire protection
system without prior notification thereof to the Deerfield-Bannockburn Fire
Protection District.

Exceptions:
1. Fire causing structural damage to the protected premises verified by the Fire
District.

ict (the “Board”) has full power pursuant to Section 6(i) of the Act

3. Tornado or hurricane winds causing structural damage to the protected

premises.

4. Flooding to the protected premises due to overflow of natural drainage.

5. Lightning causing physical damage to the protected premises.

6. Electrical service interruption verified by the Fire District.

7. Plumbing or electrical malfunctions unrelated to the fire protection system

New Section 907.10.1 shall be added to read as follows:
907.10.1 Schedule of fines. The schedule of fines for false fire alarms shall be as prescribed in
District Ordinance 2017-0-03, adopted May 11, 2017, as amended from time-to-time.

New Section 907.10.2 shall be added to read as follows:

907.10.2 Out of service alarm. If a fire alarm system gives two (2) or more false fire alarms
within a twelve (12) hour period, the Deerfield-Bannockburn Fire Protection District reserves the
right to have one of its authorized officers place the fire alarm system out-of-service and require
a fire watch at its discretion. Any fire alarm placed out-of-service under this section must be
repaired and placed back in service within the time period specified by the Deerfield-
Bannockburn Fire Protection District.

DEERFIELD-BANNOCK FPD / General / Ord 2017-O-02 Adopting the 2012 Int'l Fire Code /234746



New Section 907.10.3 shall be added to read as follows:

907.10.3 Newly installed alarms. The provisions of this ordinance for false fire alarms and
alarm malfunctions shall not apply to any newly installed alarm system for a period of thirty (30)
days from the date that the system was placed in service by a Fire Department official, but shall
apply from the expiration of the initial thirty (30) day period following installation.

Chapter 80, Referenced Standards, shall be revised by the use of the editions listed below for
certain NFPA documents:
NFPA 10 -2013

NFPA 13 -2016

NFPA 13R -2016

NFPA 13D - 2016

NFPA 14 -2016

NFPA 17A - 2017

NFPA 20 -2016

NFPA 24 -2016

NFPA 25 -2014

NFPA 30 -2015

NFPA 30A —2015

NFPA 30B - 2015

NFPA 55-2016

NFPA 58 —2017

NFPA 72 -2016

NFPA 101 - 2015

Appendix A
Is hereby deleted. Reference to Section 108 of this code for appropriate language.

Appendix B
Is hereby adopted to the text of the publication and is part of this adoption ordinance.

Appendix C
Is hereby deleted from the text of the publication and not part of this ordinance.

Appendix D, Appendix E, Appendix F, Appendix G
Are hereby adopted to the text of the publication and are part of the adoption ordinance.

Appendix H
Is hereby deleted from the text of the publication and not part of this ordinance.

Appendix I
Is hereby adopted to the text of the publication and is part of the adoption ordinance.

Appendix J
Is hereby deleted from the text of the publication and not part of this ordinance.

DEERFIELD-BANNOCK FPD / General / Ord 2017-0-02 Adopting the 2012 Int'l Fire Code /234746



STATE OF ILLINOIS )
SS
COUNTY OF LAKE )

SECRETARY'S CERTIFICATE

I, Jeffrey Hansen, the duly qualified and acting Secretary of the Board of Trustees of the
Deerfield-Bannockburn Fire Protection District, Lake County, lllinois, do hereby certify that | am
the keeper of its books and records and that the attached hereto is a true and correct copy of an
Ordinance entitled:

ORDINANCE NO. 2017-0-02
AN ORDINANCE ADOPTING UPDATED FIRE PREVENTION CODES AND

STANDARDS PARALLEL TO NATIONAL STANDARDS BY THE
DEERFIELD-BANNOCKBURN FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT, LAKE COUNTY, ILLINOIS

which Ordinance was duly adopted by said Board of Trustees at a regular meeting held on the
11th day of May, 2017.

I do further certify that a quorum of said Board of Trustees was present at said meeting
and that the Board complied with all requirements of the lllinois Open Meetings Act.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, | have hereunto set my hand this 11th day of May, 2017.

7
Jeffrey Harf§&R, Se&retary, Board of Trustees
Deerfield-Bannockburn Fire Protection District

DEERFIELD-BANNOCK FPD / General / Ord 2017-0-02 Adopting the 2012 Int'l Fire Code /234746



